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Tap the My Account link at the
top of the screen or in the
bottom menu.

Enter your card number in the
User Barcode field and your
date of birth in the password
field.

Your account will be added to
the Account Listing page. 

Linking Your Account

Download our app in the Google Play Store or the Apple App Store.
Search for “KCKPL Mobile” in the app store or visit
www.kckpl.org/mobile-app

Mobile App Cheat Sheet
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Tap the My Account link at the
top of the screen or in the
bottom menu.

This will open your Account
Page, where you can access
your information, including:

Your library card (also
accessible by clicking the Card
link in the bottom menu) 

Your checked-out items and
overdue items

Your holds and available items

Your fines and fees

Managing Your Account
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Tap the Search the Catalog link
in the center menu or in the
bottom menu.

Enter a title, author, or other
keyword to search for items. 

Tap the Filter button to filter
the results by audience, type,
and location. 

Tap on individual items to see
more details about that item or
to place a hold. 

Searching the Catalog

1
2
3

4



Tap the Digital Library Card link
in the center menu or in the
bottom menu.

This will bring up a digital
version of your card that you
can use to check out items at
our branches. 

Tap the eResources link in the
center menu.

This will bring up the list of our
most commonly used digital
resources. Tap on any icon to
visit that resource.

Digital Library Card

Using eResources
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Tap the Event Calendar link in
the center menu.

This will bring up the list of
upcoming programs and
events.

Tap the Filter button to filter
the results by age, category,
and location. 

Tap on individual programs to
learn more about them, add
them to your calendar, or
register to attend. 

The Event Calendar
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Tap the Library Information link
in the center menu.

This will bring up a list of library
locations, their open hours, and
a map. 

Tap on an individual location to
find details about that location.

Library Locations
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Tap the Contact link in the
bottom menu.

This will bring up a list of library
locations. Select a location
from the list to call that
location. 

Tap the Follow the Library link
in the center menu.

This will bring up a list of the
library’s social media accounts.
Tap on any icon to visit that
account.

Contact the Library

Follow the Library
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